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The Mayor and City Council of the City of Schuyler, Nebraska, met in special session at the Schuyler Municipal Building on 
June 12, 2023 at 5:00 PM in a publicly convened session, the same being open to the public and having been preceded by 
posting a copy of the notice in three public places in the city, as evidenced by Attachment A hereto, said form of notice being 
the designated method for giving notice.  The Mayor and City Council received advance notice of the meeting.  A copy of 
their acknowledgment of receipt of such notice is attached to these minutes.  All proceedings hereafter shown were taken 
while the meeting was open to the attendance of the public.  Mayor Lindberg convened the meeting and Clerk Johnson 
recorded the proceedings.  The following council members were present:  Baumert, Holmberg, Kasik, Kretz and Wolfe.   
Absent:  Rodriguez. 

Council member Holmberg moved the Second Reading of Ordinance No. 2023-11, title being; AN ORDINANCE TO 
PROVIDE FOR CLASSIFICATION OF OFFICIALS AND EMPLOYEES OF THE CITY OF SCHUYLER, NEBRASKA; TO 
ESTABLISH AND FIX MINIMUM AND MAXIMUM AMOUNTS OF COMPENSATION FOR SUCH OFFICIALS AND 
EMPLOYEES; TO PROVIDE FOR PAY RANGES AND RATES OF PART-TIME EMPLOYEES; TO PROVIDE FOR A DATE 
SUCH RATES OF COMPENSATION SHALL BECOME EFFECTIVE; TO PROVIDE FOR PUBLICATION IN PAMPHLET 
FORM; TO PROVIDE FOR A TIME WHEN THIS ORDINANCE SHALL TAKE EFFECT.  Council member Kasik seconded 
the motion.  Voting for:  Baumert, Holmberg, Kasik, Kretz and Wolfe.  Voting against:  no one.  Motion carried. 

Council member Holmberg moved to waive the three-reading rule.  Council member Baumert seconded the motion.  Voting 
for:  Baumert, Holmberg, Kasik, Kretz and Wolfe.  Voting against:  no one.  Motion carried. 

Council member Holmberg moved for final passage.  Council member Baumert seconded the motion.  Voting for:  Baumert, 
Holmberg, Kasik, Kretz and Wolfe.  Voting against:  no one. Motion carried.  Ordinance No. 2023-11 was passed and 
adopted. 

Council member Kasik moved to adjourn.  Council member Baumert seconded the motion.  Voting for:  Baumert, Holmberg, 
Kasik, Kretz and Wolfe.  Voting against:  no one.  Motion carried.  Meeting adjourned.   

 

ATTEST:   ________________________________________ 
    Mayor Art Lindberg 
____________________________ 
City Clerk 
 
STATE OF NEBRASKA) 
COUNTY OF COLFAX) SS 
CITY OF SCHUYLER) 
 
 
 
I, Lora Johnson, City Clerk for the City of Schuyler, Nebraska, hereby certify that all of the subjects included in the foregoing 
proceedings were contained in the agenda for said meeting, kept continually current and available for public inspection at the 
office of the City Clerk; that such subjects were in said agenda for at least twenty-four hours prior to said meeting; that the 
minutes of the City Council of Schuyler, Nebraska, from which the foregoing proceedings have been extracted, were in 
written form and available for public inspection within ten working days and prior to the next council meeting.   
 
 
______________________________ 
City Clerk Lora Johnson 


